

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for
 FOR: Personal Protective Glovegear
 TIME & DATE: (June 1, 2019 through May 31, 2020)
 3:00 p.m., April 18, 2019

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT	Safety Supply, Inc. 11827 Tech Com Rd., Ste. 114 San Antonio, TX 78260	Airgas USA, LLC 335 N WW White Rd. San Antonio, TX 78219	HD Supply C&I White Cap 10500 Broadway San Antonio, TX 78217	U.S. Wholesale Products 6109 Marion Way Cibolo, TX 78108	Patriot Source Supply 210 Daly Cove Cibolo, TX 78108	RS Hughes 5666 Randolph Blvd San Antonio, TX 78233	Ruptured Duck, LLC 6100 Kentucky St. Joshua, TX 76058	Industrial Supply Solutions, Inc. 17352 Bell North Drive Schertz, TX 78154	Tronex International Inc. 300 International Drive Mount Olive, NJ 07728	Performance Safety Group, Inc. 781A Rudder Road St. Louis, MO 63026
1.	300 pairs Nitrile gloves (Item A-1 per SAWS specifications for basic personal protective glovegear attached) Size 9, Lawson No. 12974	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	3.87 1,161.00	3.79 1,137.00	4.13 1,239.00	WITHDREW BID GROUP 1	WITHDREW BID GROUP 1	4.03 1,209.00	4.58 1,374.00	GROUP 1 NOT TABULATED NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID
	Box Quantity	BX QTY	72 pr/cs	12	12			12	12			
	Mfg. Quoting Part No.	MAKE MODEL	MCR 53550L	MCR MEG 5350L	Cordova 4522-9			Cordova 4522 S29	Lawson 12974			
	100 pairs Nitrile gloves (Item A-1 per SAWS specifications for basic personal protective glovegear attached) Size 10, Lawson No. 12977	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	3.87 387.00	3.79 379.00	4.13 413.00			4.03 403.00	4.58 458.00			
Box Quantity	BX QTY	72 pr/cs	12	12	12	12						
Mfg. Quoting Part No.	MAKE MODEL	MCR 5350XL	MCR MEG 5350XL	Cordova 4522-10	Cordova 4522 S29	Lawson 12977						
3.	200 pairs Nitrile gloves (Item A-1 per SAWS specifications for basic personal protective glovegear attached) Size 11, Lawson No. 12971	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	3.87 774.00	3.79 758.00	4.13 826.00	WITHDREW BID GROUP 1	WITHDREW BID GROUP 1	4.03 806.00	4.58 916.00	GROUP 1 NOT TABULATED NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID
	Box Quantity	BX QTY	72 pr/cs	12	12			12	12			
	Mfg. Quoting Part No.	MAKE MODEL	MCR 53505XXL	MCR MEG 53505XXL	Cordova 4522-11			Cordova 4522 S29	Lawson 12971			
	GROUP 1 TOTAL	TOTAL	2,322.00	2,274.00	2,478.00			2,418.00	2,748.00			
GROUP 2	GLOVE A-2 NITRILE GLOVES DISPOSABLE											
1.	50 box Nitrile disposable gloves (8 mil thick) (Item A-2 per SAWS specifications for basic personal protective glovegear, Size Small, Lawson No. 12973)	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4.71 235.50	4.69 234.50	5.38 269.00	4.50 225.00	4.53 226.50	5.20 260.00	5.91 295.50	7.64 382.00	WITHDREW PRICE FROM GROUP 2	3.99 199.50
	Box Quantity	BX QTY	20 bxs/cs	50	50	20 bxs/50	20 bxs/50	50	50	50		50
	Mfg. Quoting Part No.	MAKE MODEL	Cordova 4091S	Liberty Glove L422008W-S	Cordova 4091S	Cordova 4091	Cordova 4091	Cordova 4091 S2 SM	Lawson 12973	MCR 6025		PSG Diamond Grippaz HD DNPFBK-70005
	100 box Nitrile disposable gloves (8 mil thick) (Item A-2 per SAWS specifications for basic personal protective glovegear, Size Medium, Lawson No. 12972)	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4.71 706.50	4.69 703.50	5.38 807.00	4.50 675.00	4.53 679.50	5.20 780.00	5.91 886.50	7.64 1,146.00		3.99 598.50
Box Quantity	BX QTY	20 bxs/cs	50	50	20 bxs/50	20 bxs/50	50	50	50	50		
Mfg. Quoting Part No.	MAKE MODEL	Cordova 4091M	Liberty Glove L422008W-M	Cordova 4091M	Cordova 4091	Cordova 4091	Cordova 4091 S2 MD	Lawson 12972	MCR 6025	PSG Diamond Grippaz HD DNPFBK-70010		
3.	2,500 box Nitrile disposable gloves (8 mil thick) (Item A-2 per SAWS specifications for basic personal protective glove wear, Size Large, Lawson No. 12968)	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4.71 11,775.00	4.69 11,725.00	5.38 13,450.00	4.50 11,250.00	4.53 11,325.00	5.20 13,000.00	5.91 14,775.00	7.64 19,100.00	3.99 9,975.00	
	Box Quantity	BX QTY	20 box/cs	50	50	20 bxs/50	20 bxs/50	50	50	50		
	Mfg. Quoting Part No.	MAKE MODEL	Cordova 4091L	Liberty Glove L422008W-L	Cordova 4091L	Cordova 4091	Cordova 4091	Cordova 4091 S2 LG	Lawson 12968	MCR 6025	PSG Diamond Grippaz HD DNPFBK-70015	
	5,000 box Nitrile disposable gloves (8 mil thick) (Item A-2 per SAWS specifications for basic personal protective glovegear, Size X Large, Lawson No. 12976)	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4.71 23,550.00	4.69 23,450.00	5.38 26,900.00	4.50 22,500.00	4.53 22,650.00	5.20 26,000.00	5.91 29,550.00	7.64 38,200.00	3.99 19,950.00	
Box Quantity	BX QTY	20 bxs/cs	50	50	20 bxs/50	20 bxs/50	50	50	50			
Mfg. Quoting Part No.	MAKE MODEL	Cordova 4091XL	Liberty Glove L422008W-XL	Cordova 4091XL	Cordova 4091	Cordova 4091	Cordova 4091 S2 XL	Lawson 12976	MCR 6025	PSG Diamond Grippaz HD DNPFBK-70020		
GROUP 2 TOTAL	TOTAL	36,267.00	36,113.00	41,426.00	34,650.00	34,881.00	40,040.00	45,507.00	58,828.00		30,723.00	
GROUP 3	GLOVE A-3 WORK GLOVE, COWHIDE											
1.	800 pairs Cowhide work gloves, (Item A-3 per SAWS specifications for basic personal glove wear) Size Small, Lawson No. 12986	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	2.53 2,024.00	3.06 2,448.00	2.79 2,232.00	3.40 2,720.00	3.45 2,760.00	3.02 2,416.00	3.43 2,744.00	4.99 3,992.00	NO BID	NO BID
	Box Quantity	BX QTY	10 dz/cs	12 pairs	10	10 dz/cs	10 dz/cs	12	12	12		
	Mfg. Quoting Part No.	MAKE MODEL	Cordova 8212S	PIP PIP68-1635B/S	Cordova 8212S	Cordova 8212	Cordova 8212	Cordova 8210 S2 SM	Lawson 12986	Memphis 3213		

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for
FOR: Personal Protective Glovewear
TIME & DATE: (June 1, 2019 through May 31, 2020)
3:00 p.m., April 18, 2019

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT	Safety Supply, Inc. 11827 Tech Com Rd., Ste. 114 San Antonio, TX 78260	Airgas USA, LLC 335 N WW White Rd. San Antonio, TX 78219	HD Supply C&I White Cap 10500 Broadway San Antonio, TX 78217	U.S. Wholesale Products 6109 Marion Way Cibolo, TX 78108	Patriot Source Supply 210 Daly Cove Cibolo, TX 78108	RS Hughes 5666 Randolph Blvd San Antonio, TX 78233	Ruptured Duck, LLC 6100 Kentucky St. Joshua, TX 76058	Industrial Supply Solutions, Inc. 17352 Ball North Drive Schertz, TX 78154	Tronex International Inc. 300 International Drive Mount Olive, NJ 077828	Performance Safety Group, Inc. 781A Rudder Road St. Louis, MO 63026
2.	2,000 pairs Cowhide work gloves, (Item A-3 per SAWS specifications for basic personal glove wear) Size Medium, Lawson No. 12984	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	2.53 5,060.00	3.06 6,120.00	2.79 5,580.00	3.40 6,800.00	3.45 6,900.00	3.02 6,040.00	3.43 6,860.00	4.99 9,980.00	NO BID	NO BID
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	10 dz/cs Cordova 8212M	12 pairs PIP PIP68-1635B/M	10 Cordova 8212M	10 dz/cs Cordova 8212	10 dz/cs Cordova 8212	12 Cordova 8210 S2 MD	TBD Lawson 12984	12 Memphis 3213		
3.	4,000 pairs Cowhide work gloves (Item A-3 per SAWS specifications for basic personal glovewear) Size Large, Lawson No. 12982	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	2.53 10,120.00	3.06 12,240.00	2.79 11,160.00	3.40 13,600.00	3.45 13,800.00	3.02 12,080.00	3.43 13,720.00	4.99 19,960.00		
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	10 dz/cs Cordova 8212L	12 pairs PIP PIP68-1635B/L	10 Cordova 8212L	10 dz/cs Cordova 8212	10 dz/cs Cordova 8212	12 Cordova 8210 S2 LG	TBD Lawson 12982	12 Memphis 3213		
4.	2,500 pairs Cowhide work gloves (Item A-3 per SAWS specifications for basic personal glovewear) Size X Large, Lawson No.12987	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	2.53 6,325.00	3.25 8,125.00	2.79 6,975.00	3.40 8,500.00	3.45 8,625.00	3.22 8,050.00	3.66 9,150.00	5.21 13,025.00		
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	10 dz/cs Cordova 8212XL	12 pairs PIP PIP68-1635B/XL	10 Cordova 8212XL	10 dz/cs Cordova 8212	10 dz/cs Cordova 8212	12 Cordova 8210 S2 XL	TBD Lawson 12987	12 Memphis 3213		
5.	1,000 pairs Cowhide work gloves (Item A-3 per SAWS specifications for basic personal glovewear) Size 2X Large, Lawson No. 12979	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	2.69 2,690.00	3.53 3,530.00	2.79 2,790.00	3.40 3,400.00	3.45 3,450.00	3.43 3,430.00	3.90 3,900.00	5.66 5,660.00		
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	10 dz/cs Cordova 8212XXL	12 pairs PIP PIP68-163/XXL	10 Cordova 8212-2XL	10 dz/cs Cordova 8212	10 dz/cs Cordova 8212	12 Cordova 8210 S2 XXL	TBD Lawson 12979	12 Memphis 3213		
6.	36 pairs Cowhide work gloves (Item A-3 per SAWS specifications for basic personal glovewear) Size 3X Large, Lawson No. 12980	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	2.69 96.84	3.82 137.52	3.00 108.00	3.40 122.40	3.45 124.20	3.63 130.68	4.12 148.32	5.86 210.96		
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	10 dz/cs Cordova 8212XXXL	12 pairs PIP PIP68-163/XXL	10 Cordova 8212-3XL	10 dz/cs Cordova 8212	10 dz/cs Cordova 8212	12 Cordova 8210 S2 XXXL	TBD Lawson 12980	12 Memphis 3213		
	GROUP 3 TOTAL	TOTAL	26,315.84	32,600.52	28,845.00	35,142.40	35,659.20	32,146.68	36,522.32	52,827.96		
GROUP 4	GLOVE A-4 GLOVE - RUBBER COATED, RIB KNIT LINED											
1.	96 pairs Rubber coated, rib knit lined gloves (Gauntlet style) (Item A-4 per SAWS Specifications for basic personal glovewear attached) Size Small, Lawson No. 12947	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	0.75 72.00	2.98 286.08	3.38 324.48	1.49 143.04	1.55 148.80	3.16 303.36	3.59 344.64	3.64 349.44		
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	12 dz/cs Global Glove 180FS	12 pairs MCR MEG6885S	12 MCR 6885-S	12 pk/cs Frogwear 180F	12 pk/cs Frogwear 180F	12 MCR 6885 S2 SM	TBD Lawson 12947	12 MCR 6885		
2.	250 pairs Rubber coated, rib knit lined gloves (Gauntlet style) (Item A-4 per SAWS Specifications for basic personal glovewear attached) Size Medium, Lawson No. 12946	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	0.75 187.50	2.98 745.00	3.38 845.00	1.49 372.50	1.55 387.50	3.16 790.00	3.59 897.50	3.64 910.00		
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	12dz/cs Global Glove 180FM	12 pairs MCR MEG6885M	12 MCR 6885-M	12 pk/cs Frogwear 180F	12 pk/cs Frogwear 180F	12 MCR 6885 S2 MD	TBD Lawson 12946	12 MCR 6885		
3.	800 pairs Rubber coated, rib knit lined gloves (Gauntlet style) (Item A-4 per SAWS Specifications for basic personal glovewear attached) Size Large, Lawson No. 12945	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	0.75 600.00	2.98 2,384.00	3.38 2,704.00	1.49 1,192.00	1.55 1,240.00	3.16 2,528.00	3.59 2,872.00	3.64 2,912.00		
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	12 dz/cs Global Glove 180FM	12 pairs MCR MEG6885L	12 MCR 6885-L	12 pk/cs Frogwear 180F	12 pk/cs Frogwear 180F	12 MCR 6885 S2 LG	TBD Lawson 12945	12 MCR 6885		

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for
 FOR: Personal Protective Glovegear
 TIME & (June 1, 2019 through May 31, 2020)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., April 18, 2019

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT	Safety Supply, Inc. 11827 Tech Com Rd., Ste. 114 San Antonio, TX 78260	Airgas USA, LLC 335 N WW White Rd. San Antonio, TX 78219	HD Supply C&I White Cap 10500 Broadway San Antonio, TX 78217	U.S. Wholesale Products 6109 Marion Way Cibolo, TX 78108	Patriot Source Supply 210 Daly Cove Cibolo, TX 78108	RS Hughes 5666 Randolph Blvd San Antonio, TX 78233	Ruptured Duck, LLC 6100 Kentucky St. Joshua, TX 76058	Industrial Supply Solutions, Inc. 17352 Ball North Drive Schertz, TX 78154	Tronex International Inc. 300 International Drive Mount Olive, NJ 077828	Performance Safety Group, Inc. 781A Rudder Road St. Louis, MO 63026
4.	1,500 pairs Rubber coated, rib knit lined gloves (Gauntlet style) (Item A-4 per SAWS Specifications for basic personal glovegear attached) Size X Large, Lawson No. 12948	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	0.75 1,125.00	2.98 4,470.00	3.38 5,070.00	1.49 2,235.00	1.55 2,325.00	3.16 4,740.00	3.59 5,385.00	3.64 5,460.00	NO BID	NO BID
	Box Quantity	BX QTY	12 dz/cs	12 pairs	12	12 pk/cs	12 pk/cs	12	TBD	12		
	Mfg. Quoting	MAKE	Global Glove	MCR	MCR	Frogwear	Frogwear	MCR	Lawson	MCR		
	Part No.	MODEL	180FXL	MEG6885XL	6885-XL	180F	180F	6885 S2 XL	12948	6885		
5.	500 pairs Rubber coated, rib knit lined gloves (Gauntlet style) (Item A-4 per SAWS Specifications for basic personal glovegear attached) Gloves Astro Flex, Size XX Large, Lawson No. 34333	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	0.75 375.00	2.98 1,490.00	3.38 1,690.00	1.49 745.00	1.55 775.00	3.16 1,580.00	3.59 1,795.00	3.64 1,820.00		
	Box Quantity	BX QTY	12 dz/cs	12 pairs	12	12 pk/cs	12 pk/cs	12	TBD	12		
	Mfg. Quoting	MAKE	Global Glove	MCR	MCR	Frogwear	Frogwear	MCR	Lawson	MCR		
	Part No.	MODEL	180FXXL	MEG6885XXL	6885-2XL	180F	180F	6885 S2 XXL	12933	6885		
	GROUP 4 TOTAL	TOTAL	2,359.50	9,375.08	10,633.48	4,687.54	4,876.30	9,941.36	11,294.14	11,451.44		
GROUP 5	GLOVE A-5 GLOVE: GENERAL PURPOSE GLOVE (9 1/2 INCH)											
1.	144 pairs General Propose, 9 1/2", Material Polyurethane Liner Seamless knit, cuff elasticize (SAWS specifications 600-34 for basic personal glovegear attached), Size 6, Lawson No. 12956	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	2.03 292.32	2.25 324.00	2.13 306.72	2.89 416.16	3.00 432.00	3.24 466.56	3.68 529.92	6.47 931.68		
	Box Quantity	BX QTY	144 pr/cs	12 pairs	12	144 pr/cs	144 pr/cs	12	TBD	12		
	Mfg. Quoting	MAKE	Cordova	PIP	Cordova	Cordova	Cordova	MCR	Lawson	Memphis		
	Part No.	MODEL	3716XS	PIP 15-150/S	3716-6	3716	3716	92723PU S26	12956	9672		
2.	600 pairs General Propose, 9 1/2", Material Polyurethane Liner Seamless knit, cuff elasticize (SAWS specifications 600-34 for basic personal glovegear attached) Size 7, Lawson No. 12957	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	2.03 1,218.00	2.25 1,350.00	2.13 1,278.00	2.89 1,734.00	3.00 1,800.00	3.24 1,944.00	3.68 2,208.00	6.47 3,882.00		
	Box Quantity	BX QTY	144 pr/cs	12 pairs	12	144 pr/cs	144 pr/cs	12	TBD	12		
	Mfg. Quoting	MAKE	Cordova	PIP	Cordova	Cordova	Cordova	MCR	Lawson	Memphis		
	Part No.	MODEL	3716S	PIP 15-150/M	3716-7	3716	3716	92723PU S27	12957	9672		
3.	1,700 pairs General Propose, 9 1/2", Material Polyurethane Liner Seamless knit, cuff elasticize (SAWS specifications 600-34 for basic personal glovegear attached) Size 8, Lawson No. 12958	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	2.03 3,451.00	2.25 3,825.00	2.13 3,621.00	2.89 4,913.00	3.00 5,100.00	3.24 5,508.00	3.68 6,256.00	6.47 10,999.00		
	Box Quantity	BX QTY	144 pr/cs	12 pairs	12	144 pr/cs	144 pr/cs	12	TBD	12		
	Mfg. Quoting	MAKE	Cordova	PIP	Cordova	Cordova	Cordova	MCR	Lawson	Memphis		
	Part No.	MODEL	3716M	PIP 15-150/L	3716-8	3716	3716	92723PU S28	12958	9672		
4.	4,500 pairs General Propose, 9 1/2" Material Polyurethane Liner Seamless knit, cuff elasticize (SAWS specifications 600-34 for basic personal glovegear attached) Size 9, Lawson No. 12959	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	2.03 9,135.00	2.25 10,125.00	2.13 9,585.00	2.89 13,005.00	3.00 13,500.00	3.24 14,580.00	3.68 16,560.00	6.47 29,115.00		
	Box Quantity	BX QTY	144 pr/cs	12 pairs	12	144 pr/cs	144 pr/cs	12	TBD	12		
	Mfg. Quoting	MAKE	Cordova	PIP	Cordova	Cordova	Cordova	MCR	Lawson	Memphis		
	Part No.	MODEL	3716L	PIP 15-150/XL	3716-9	3716	3716	92723PU S29	12959	9672		
5.	7,000 pairs General Propose, 9 1/2" Material Polyurethane Liner Seamless knit, cuff elasticize (SAWS specifications 600-34 for basic personal glovegear attached) Size 10, Lawson No. 12955	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	2.03 14,210.00	2.25 15,750.00	2.13 14,910.00	2.89 20,230.00	3.00 21,000.00	3.24 22,680.00	3.68 25,760.00	6.47 45,290.00		
	Box Quantity	BX QTY	144 pr/cs	12 pairs	12	144 pr/cs	144 pr/cs	12	TBD	12		
	Mfg. Quoting	MAKE	Cordova	PIP	Cordova	Cordova	Cordova	MCR	Lawson	Memphis		
	Part No.	MODEL	3716XL	PIP 15-150/XXL	3716-10	3716	3716	92723PU S10	12955	9672		
	GROUP 5 TOTAL	TOTAL	28,306.32	31,374.00	29,700.72	40,298.16	41,832.00	45,178.56	51,313.92	90,217.68		

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for
 FOR: Personal Protective Glovegear
 TIME & DATE: (June 1, 2019 through May 31, 2020)
 3:00 p.m., April 18, 2019

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		Safety Supply, Inc. 11827 Tech Com Rd., Ste. 114 San Antonio, TX 78260	Airgas USA, LLC 335 N WW White Rd. San Antonio, TX 78219	HD Supply C&I White Cap 10500 Broadway San Antonio, TX 78217	U.S. Wholesale Products 6109 Marion Way Cibolo, TX 78108	Patriot Source Supply 210 Daly Cove Cibolo, TX 78108	RS Hughes 5666 Randolph Blvd San Antonio, TX 78233	Ruptured Duck, LLC 6100 Kentucky St. Joshua, TX 76058	Industrial Supply Solutions, Inc. 17352 Bell North Drive Schertz, TX 78154	Tronex International Inc. 300 International Drive Mount Olive, NJ 077828	Performance Safety Group, Inc. 781A Rudder Road St. Louis, MO 63026			
GROUP 6	GLOVE A-6 GLOVE CHEMICAL RESISTANCE REUSABLE				MISTAKE IN PRICE GROUP 6 PRICES WITHDRAWN						NO BID	NO BID			
1.	24 pairs Glove Chemical Resistance reusable material: supported nitrile Color: Blue Length 26" Sizes 8 (Medium)(Item A-6 per SAWS specifications for basic personal protective glovegear attached Manufacturer North (Honeywell) Model NK803ESIN, Lawson No. 42945	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	22.87 14.99 548.88	14.99 14.99 359.76		17.55 17.55 421.20	17.55 17.55 421.20	20.15 20.15 483.60	22.90 22.90 549.60	37.31 37.31 895.44					
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	North NK803ESIN/8	Honeywell HONNK803ESIN/8		North Honeywell NK803ES	North Honeywell NK803ES	North Honeywell NK803ESIN S28	Lawson 42945	North Honeywell NK803ESIN					
2.	48 pairs Glove Chemical Resistance reusable material: supported nitrile Color: Blue Length 26" Sizes 9 (Large) (Item A-6 per SAWS specifications for basic personal protective glovegear attached) Manufacturer North (Honeywell) Model NK803ESIN, Lawson No. 42946	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	22.87 1,097.76	14.99 719.52		17.55 842.40	17.55 842.40	20.15 967.20	22.90 1,099.20	37.31 1,790.88					
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	North NK803ESIN/9	Honeywell HONNK803ESIN/9		North Honeywell NK803ES	North Honeywell NK803ES	North Honeywell NK803ESIN S29	Lawson 42946	North Honeywell NK803ESIN					
3.	48 pairs Glove Chemical Resistant reusable material: supported nitrile Color: Blue Length 26" Sizes 10 (X-Large) (Items A-6 per SAWS specifications for basic personal protective glovegear attached) Manufacturer North (Honeywell) Model NK803ESIN, Lawson No. 42947	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	22.87 1,097.76	14.99 719.52		17.55 842.40	17.55 842.40	20.15 967.20	22.90 1,099.20	37.31 1,790.88					
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	North NK803ESIN/10	Honeywell HONNK803ESIN/10		North Honeywell NK803ES	North Honeywell NK803ES	North Honeywell NK803ESIN S210	Lawson 42947	North Honeywell NK803ESIN					
4.	24 pairs Glove Chemical Resistance reusable material: supported nitrile Color: Blue Length 26" Sizes 11 (XX-Large) (Item A-6 per SAWS specifications for basic personal protective glovegear attached) Manufacturer North (Honeywell) Model NK803ESIN, Lawson No. 42948	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	22.87 548.88	14.99 359.76		17.55 421.20	17.55 421.20	20.15 483.60	22.90 549.60	37.31 895.44					
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	North NK803ESIN/11	Honeywell HONNK803ESIN/11		North Honeywell NK803ES	North Honeywell NK803ES	North Honeywell NK803ESIN S211	Lawson 42948	North Honeywell NK803ESIN					
	GROUP 6 TOTAL	TOTAL	3,293.28	2,158.56		2,527.20	2,527.20	2,901.60	3,297.60	5,372.64					
GROUP 7	GLOVE A-7 GLOVE NEEDLESTICK RESISTANCER														
1.	12 pairs Glove Needlestick resistancer length 14" Sizes 7 (Small) (Item A-7 per SAWS specifications for basic personal protective glovegear attached). Manufacturer HexArmor Model SharpMaster II 9014, Lawson No. 42941	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	42.50 510.00	30.17 362.04		33.18 398.16	35.50 426.00	35.50 426.00	30.75 369.00	34.94 419.28			61.74 740.88		
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	HexArmor 9014-S	HexArmor PF39014-S	HexArmor 9014-7	HexArmor 9014	HexArmor 9014	HexArmor 9014 S27	Lawson 42941	HexArmor Sharpmaster II 9014					
2.	12 pairs Glove Needlestick resistancer Length 14" Sizes 8 (Medium) (Item A-7 per SAWS specifications for basic personal protective glovegear attached). Manufacturer Hex Armor Model SharpMaster II 9014, Lawson No. 42942	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	42.50 510.00	30.17 362.04	33.18 398.16	35.50 426.00	35.50 426.00	30.75 369.00	34.94 419.28	61.74 740.88					
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	HexArmor 9014-M	HexArmor PF39014-M	HexArmor 9014-8	HexArmor 9014	HexArmor 9014	HexArmor 9014 S28	Lawson 42942	HexArmor Sharpmaster II 9014					
3.	12 pairs Glove Needlestick resistancer Length 14" sizes 9 (Large) (Item A-7 per SAWS specifications for basic personal protective glovegear attached). Manufacturer Hex Armor Model SharpMaster II 9014, Lawson No. 42943	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	42.50 510.00	30.17 362.04	33.18 398.16	35.50 426.00	35.50 426.00	30.75 369.00	34.94 419.28	61.74 740.88					
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	HexArmor 9014-L	HexArmor PF39014-L	HexArmor 9014-9	HexArmor 9014	HexArmor 9014	HexArmor 9014 S29	Lawson 42943	HexArmor Sharpmaster II 9014					

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for
 FOR: Personal Protective Glovegear
 TIME & DATE: (June 1, 2019 through May 31, 2020)
 3:00 p.m., April 18, 2019

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		Safety Supply, Inc. 11827 Tech Com Rd., Ste. 114 San Antonio, TX 78260	Airgas USA, LLC 335 N WW White Rd. San Antonio, TX 78219	HD Supply C&I White Cap 10500 Broadway San Antonio, TX 78217	U.S. Wholesale Products 6109 Marion Way Cibolo, TX 78108	Patriot Source Supply 210 Daly Cove Cibolo, TX 78108	RS Hughes 5666 Randolph Blvd San Antonio, TX 78233	Ruptured Duck, LLC 6100 Kentucky St. Joshua, TX 76058	Industrial Supply Solutions, Inc. 17352 Bell North Drive Schertz, TX 78154	Tronex International Inc. 300 International Drive Mount Olive, NJ 07728	Performance Safety Group, Inc. 781A Rudder Road St. Louis, MO 63026
4.	12 pairs Glove Needlestick resistancer Length 14" Sizes 10 (X-Large) (Item A-7 per SAWS specifications for basic personal protective glovegear attached). Manufacturer HexArmor Model SharpMaster II 9014	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	42.50 510.00	30.69 368.28	33.63 403.56	35.50 426.00	35.50 426.00	30.75 369.00	34.94 419.28	61.74 740.88	NO BID	NO BID
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	HexArmor 9014-XL	HexArmor PF39014-XL	HexArmor 9014-10	HexArmor 9014	HexArmor 9014	HexArmor 9014 S10	Lawson 42944	HexArmor Sharpmaster II 9014		
	GROUP 7 TOTAL	TOTAL	2,040.00	1,454.40	1,598.04	1,704.00	1,704.00	1,476.00	1,677.12	2,963.52		
GROUP 8	A-8 WORK GLOVES, MULTI-TASK											
1.	700 pairs Work Gloves, MULTI-TASK Length 14" Size 8 (Medium) (Item A-8 per SAWS specifications for basic personal protective glovegear attached), Lawson No. 50186	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	8.27 5,789.00	11.27 7,889.00	11.25 7,875.00	9.10 6,370.00	9.20 6,440.00	11.46 8,022.00	13.02 9,114.00	12.27 8,589.00		
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	Cordova 7735M	MCR MEGUT2952M	Cordova OGRE 7739-8	Cordova 3734 TPR	Cordova 3734 TPR	MCR UT2952 S28	Lawson 50186	Memphis UT2952		
2.	700 pairs Work Gloves, MULTI-TASK Length 14" Size 9 (Large) (Item A-8 per SAWS specifications for basic personal protective glovegear attached)	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	8.27 5,789.00	11.27 7,889.00	11.25 7,875.00	9.10 6,370.00	9.20 6,440.00	11.46 8,022.00	13.02 9,114.00	12.27 8,589.00		
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	Cordova 7735L	MCR MEGUT2952L	Cordova OGRE 7739-9	Cordova 3734 TPR	Cordova 3734 TPR	MCR UT2952 S29	Lawson N/A	Memphis UT2952		
3.	700 pairs Work Gloves, MULTI-TASK Length 14" Size 10 (X-Large) (Item A-8 per SAWS specifications for basic personal protective glovegear attached), Lawson No. 50187	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	8.27 5,789.00	11.27 7,889.00	11.25 7,875.00	9.10 6,370.00	9.20 6,440.00	11.46 8,022.00	13.02 9,114.00	12.27 8,589.00		
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	Cordova 7735XL	MCR MEGUT2952XL	Cordova OGRE 7739-10	Cordova 3734 TPR	Cordova 3734 TPR	MCR UT2952 S10	Lawson 50187	Memphis UT2952		
	GROUP 8 TOTAL	TOTAL	17,367.00	23,667.00	23,625.00	19,110.00	19,320.00	24,066.00	27,342.00	25,767.00		
	TOTAL AWARD PER GROUPS	TOTAL	74,348.66	5,886.96								
	EXTENSION 1		74,348.66	5,886.96								30,723.00
	EXTENSION 2		74,348.66	5,886.96								30,723.00
	EXTENSION 3		74,348.66	5,886.96								30,723.00
	EXTENSION 4		74,348.66	5,886.96								30,723.00
	Terms		2% 10 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days
	Delivery Days		1-2 days	5-7 days	7 days	1-3 days	1-3 days	5 days	10 days	7 days		5 days

*LOW BIDDER

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for
 FOR: Personal Protective Glovegear
 TIME & (June 1, 2019 through May 31, 2020)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., April 18, 2019
 ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Safety Supply, Inc.
 11827 Tech Com Rd., Ste. 114
 San Antonio, TX 78260

Airgas USA, LLC
 335 N WW White Rd.
 San Antonio, TX 78219

HD Supply C&I White Cap
 10500 Broadway
 San Antonio, TX 78217

U.S. Wholesale Products
 6109 Marion Way
 Cibolo, TX 78108

Patriot Sourc Supply
 210 Daly Cove
 Cibolo, TX 78108

RS Hughes
 5666 Randolph Blvd
 San Antonio, TX 78233

Ruptured Duck, LLC
 6100 Kentucky St.
 Joshua, TX 76058

Industrial Supply Solutions, Inc.
 17352 Bell North Drive
 Schertz, TX 78154

Tronex International Inc.
 300 International Drive
 Mount Olive, NJ 077828

Performance Safety Group, Inc.
 781A Rudder Road
 St. Louis, MO 63026

BID INVITATIONS WERE E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Tronex
 Airgas
 Alamo Iron Works
 Baytech Supply
 Conney Safety
 Fastenal
 Grainger
 HD Supply
 Industrial Supply Solutions
 ORR Corp
 Patriot Source Supply

PSG Gear
 Ritz Safety
 RS Hughes
 Ruptured Duck LLC
 Safety Supply, Inc.
 Saf-T-Glove
 Sunbelt Mill Supply
 Unipak Corp
 US Wholesale
 Wesco

Demandstar
 SAWS Website